
FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

Item #

Packaging 

(count       

per case 

OR each 

OR pound)

Price          

per case OR 

Each OR 

Pound

Item #

Packaging 

(count       

per case 

OR each 

OR pound)

Price            

per case OR 

Each OR 

Pound

Item #

Packaging 

(count       

per case 

OR each 

OR pound)

 Price          

per case OR 

Each OR 

Pound 

1 BACON, precooked - 300 ct
28870 2/150CNT 28.41         

2 BEEF LIVER,  40/4 oz
33051 40/4oz 20.62

3
CHICKEN BREAST, 

BONELESS, random - 40# 96094 4/10 LB 41.24         

4

CHICKEN BREAST, 

BONELESS, SKINLESS - 

approx 4 oz CA462 2/5 LB 23.84         

5
CHICKEN BREAST CUTLETS 

- approx 4-6 oz CA466 3/5 LB 31.82         

6

CHICKEN BREAST, 

STUFFED, 6-8 oz, skin on 

bread stuffing 1412006 24/7 OZ

$57.85       

per case  

7
CHICKEN CORDON BLEU - 4 

oz 41126 36/4 ounce          45.04 

8 CHICKEN, DICED - 10#
10246 2/5# 29.45

9

CHICKEN STRIPS FOR 

FAJITAS: seasoned, boneless, 

fully cooked - 10# 55103 2/5# 36.49

10 CHICKEN THIGHS, BONE IN
5207145 2/10#AVG $3.16 per lb 93838 43/Lb          50.07 

11
CUBE STEAK, 4-5 oz  no 

JacPac, no fillers 33050 40/4oz 41.58

12
GROUND BEEF - 80/20 - 

fresh - 4/5# 46050 4/5 LB 44.73         

13
GROUND BEEF - 80/20 - 

frozen - 4/5# 37746 4/5 Lb          43.23 

14
GROUND BEEF - 80/20 - 

frozen - 8/10# 0566838 4/10# AV $2.20 per lb

15

GROUND BEEF: 100%, 90% 

lean, no fillers, frozen or fresh - 

10# 0566681 4/5#AV $3.67 per lb

16 GROUND TURKEY - 4/5#
7268279 4/5 LB

$22.77       

per case

17
HAM, REDUCED SODIUM, 

2/10-15 lb per cs - Not Deli 19152 Frzn

2/11#avg 

LS 3.39/#

18
HAM, SMOKED WHOLE, 2/14-

19 lb  19064 4/15#avg 2.42/#

19
ITALIAN SAUSAGE LINKS, 

approx 4 oz - 10# 2434355 40/4 OZ

$29.71       

per case

20

PORK BREAKFAST 

SAUSAGE LINKS, approx 1 oz 

- 10# 40102 10/LB 19.58         

21
PORK CHOP,  BONELESS, 

approx 40/4 oz 15162 40/4oz 31.65

RENZI

PRODUCT

REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

MEAT

11/21/2019 dt 1



FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

22
PORK CHOPS, approx 40/4 

oz, center cut, 1/2" lean 15155 40/4oz 32.98

23
PORK LOINS, boneless, lean 

unseasoned - 6/5-9# K9806 6/8 UP 1.47           

24
SALISBURY STEAK, approx 4 

oz, JakPac acceptable - 10# 15839

84/4oz - 

21#cs 3.11/#

25

STEW BEEF  lean USDA 

choice, 3/4" cubes: NO jac-pac 

- 10# 14019 10# 3.57/#

26

TOP ROUNDS, 4/8-12 lb, 

USDA choice, trimmed, split 

and tied 1111913 2/8-11# $3.04 per lb

27

TURKEY BREAST, 2/8-10lb,  

premium grade, not deli, 

cooked, skinless 54036 2/10#avg 2.82/#

1 BABY BACK RIBS - 16/2.25#
17111 16/2.5#avg 3.27/#

2

BEEF PATTIES:  80% lean, 

100% beef, 3 patties/pound, 

round, paper in between 

patties - 10# G1438 30/5.33 29.37         

3
BREAKFAST SAUSAGE 

PATTIES - approx 1 oz G1808 10/LB 24.11         

4

BREAKFAST SAUSAGE 

PATTIES, VEGETARIAN - 

112/cs 23048 SPO

112/1.34 

oz 48.49 79460 112/CNT 49.69         

5

BREADED CHICKEN PATTY, 

approx 3 oz, oven ready, white 

meat 53210 10.35#cs 20.85

6 BREADED FISH COOKED 
40156 80/3.6oz 44.70

7

BREADED FISH : uncooked, 

ready to bake, NOT DEEP 

FRY, comparable to Pier 17 1072982 4/2.5 LB

$42.02       

per case 40161 SPO 46/3.6oz 29.97

8
BREADED FISH FILLETS - 

approx 4 oz 5014661 1/10 LB

$30.51       

per case

9
CHICKEN BREAST, 

BONELESS, SKINLESS 7203474 4/10 LB

$47.82       

per case

10

CHICKEN BREASTS, approx 

6.5 oz,  bone in and skin on, 

no backs, no ribs, IQF 0778217 48/6OZ

$71.26       

per case

11
CHICKEN FILLETS, 

BREADED - approx 4 oz V6496 2/5 LB 24.89         

12
CHICKEN LEGS - approx 6 

oz, IQF 44150 22/LB 43.31         

13

CHICKEN MEAT, DICED: 

cooked, white & dark meat, 

IQF 10246 2/5# 29.05

14 CHICKEN NUGGET
55054 225/.71oz 19.55

15 CHICKEN PATTY
53210 2/5# 19.45

FROZEN FOOD
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16 CUBED PORK
17079 2/5# 23.90

17 DANISH - assorted
51236 50/1.25oz 21.79

18 DICED TURKEY
10161 2/5# 25.29

19
DINNER ROLLS - 1 oz - proof 

& bake R6574 288/1.25 36.68         

20 DONUT - assorted
51119 126/1.3oz 23.77

21 FISH NUGGETS - approx 1 oz
40157 4/5# 57.79

22 FRENCH FRIES
34115 6/5# 17.19

23
FRENCH TOAST - SLICES, 

Not Sticks 1783927 144/1.5 OZ

$42.57       

per case

24
GARLIC BREAD - PRE-

SLICED, Individual - 125/bx 51647 125/1.2oz 22.69

25
HASHBROWN - approx 2.25 

oz 34210 240/2.25oz 42.24

26 HOT DOGS - All Beef
41764 2/5 Lb          25.78 

27 HOT DOGS (approx 80 cs)
22999 10.5# case 18.80

28 HOT DOGS - LOW SODIUM 
14094

8/1# - 

10#case 20.45

29 HOT DOGS - TURKEY
23099 160/2oz 26.79

30
ITALIAN SAUSAGE CUBES:  

cooked 10489 4/5# 47.60

31 MANICOTTI - approx 3 oz
35243 60/2.75oz 30.45

32 MEATBALLS
11234 10# 21.39

33 MEATLOAF SLICES
33167

75/3.2oz 

15# case 48.37

34 OMELETS - approx 1 oz
9546797 200/1 OZ

$35.45       

per case

35 OMELETS - approx 3 oz
B7934 84/3 OZ 42.29         

36 PANCAKES
46034 144/1.2oz 16.40

37
PANCAKES - BUTTERMILK - 

approx 1.2 oz 46001 144/1.3oz 18.80

38 PEPPERONI: sliced
32067 10# 30.96

39 PIE SHELLS - 10" - Unbaked
48006 20ct 21.25

40
PIZZA, CHEESE, 5" ROUND - 

approx 5 oz A6786 60/CNT 41.84         

41
PIZZA CRUST, sheet pan - 

approx 24 oz 38713 12/24oz 19.60
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42
PIZZA CRUST, sheet pan - 

approx 44 oz 37807 10/43oz 23.24

43 PIZZA TOPPING, SAUSAGE
10489 4/5# 49.10

44
POLLOCK POTATO CRUNCH 

NUGGET - approx 1 oz
40157 4/5# 57.79

45 POPCORN CHICKEN, Plain
55121 2/5# 25.65

46
PORK BBQ RIBETTES, 

cooked, approx 3-4 oz 33024 75/3.2oz 51.61

47
POTATOES, CUBED (to pan 

fry) 34109 4/5# 28.47

48 PULLED TURKEY
52031 2/5# 39.75

49 RAVIOLI
86212 4/3# 25.05

50 STEAK UM
33168 56/3oz 36.70

51 SWEET POTATO FRIES
34120 6/2.5# 28.79

52
STUFFED SHELLS - approx 2 

oz 35249 2/7.5# 40.19

53 TATOR TOT - approx 1 oz
34008 8/5# 26.35

54
TURKEY, WHOLE - raw, 

frozen 1032143 2/20-22# $1.09 per lb

55
TURKEY BREAST - raw, 

frozen 52036 2/11#avg 2.73/#

56
UNBREADED FISH FILLETS - 

approx 4 oz
8085698 4/10 LB

$122.09       

per case New - SPO

2/4oz 10# 

UPC#1002

976 29.70

57
UNBREADED VEAL PATTY - 

approx 4 oz 99418 10/LB 36.22         

58 VEGGIE BURGER, regular
11100 SPO 48/3.4oz 51.65 30064 48/3.4OZ 52.42         

59
VEGGIE BURGER, 

southwestern 9349960 48/3.4 OZ

$53.52       

per case 11075 SPO 48/3.4oz 50.56

60 WAFFLES
46009 144/1.23oz 16.99

61 WRAPS - 12"
60048 6/12ct 16.47

1 TUNA FISH - 12 oz
43232 SPO

24/12oz in 

water 64.09

2 TUNA FISH - 66.5 oz
64025

6/66.5oz in 

water 44.10

1 EGG PATTIES - 1 oz - frozen
27062 144/1oz 19.78

2
EGG PATTIES - 1.75 oz - 

frozen 27092 144/1.75oz 34.40

FISH

EGGS
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3 EGG PATTIES - 2 oz - frozen
27093 100/2oz 26.49

4 FRESH EGGS - 15/doz
28006 15doz 12.95

5 FRESH EGGS - 30/doz
28028 30doz 23.95

6 PASTEURIZED EGGS - 15/2#
27048 15/2# 44.20

7
PEELED HARD COOKED - 

25# 28108 25# 47.75

1 BARLEY
78309 SPO 24/1# 20.37

2
CASSEROLE ElbOW 

NOODLES 76884 2/10# 19.95

3 EGG NOODLES
84082 1/10# 11.99

4 ElbOW MACARONI
84073 20# 15.48

5 LASAGNA NOODLES
76879 12/1# 15.10

6 RICE - par boil - 25#
66014 25# 13.30

7 RICE - par boil - 50#
4323366 1/50 LB

$29.69       

per case

8 ROTINI - tricolor
28036 2/10 LB 23.03         

9 ROTINI - plain
84083 20# 16.49

10 SHELLS - Medium Size
76913 20# 19.78

11 SPAGHETTI
84072 20# 17.25

12 ZITI
84074 2/10# 17.25

1 BAKING COCOA
92337 6/5# 82.15

2 BAKING POWDER
68064 6/5# 39.99

3 BAKING SODA
68058 24/1# 15.40

4 CANOLA OIL
J2902 6/1 GAL 29.02         

5 COCONUT: unsweetened
4510921 5/2 LB

$26.28       

per case

6 CORN STARCH
91369 24/1# 16.90

7 CRAISINS
6889125 1/10 LB

$26.27       

per case 82696 5/LB 16.69         

8 FLOUR - 25#
10820 2/25# 15.21

BAKING PRODUCTS

PASTA & GRAINS
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9 FLOUR - 50#
4267274 1/50 LB

$16.18       

per case

10
PEANUT BUTTER CHIPS - 

25# 75071 SPO 25# 68.90

11
SEMI-SWEET CHOCOLATE 

CHIPS - 25# 92210 25# 44.67

12 SHORTENING
10954 50# 33.10

13 SUGAR, BROWN - 2# 
11183 12/2# 25.09

14 SUGAR, BROWN - 50#
67009 50# 34.80

15
SUGAR, CONFECTIONERY - 

2# 92205 12/2# 24.32

16
SUGAR, CONFECTIONERY - 

50# 67007 50# 34.80

17 SUGAR, GRANULATED - 5#
68393 10/4# 28.97

18 SUGAR, GRANULATED - 50#
68395 50# 29.75

19 VANILLA EXTRACT - Gal
96205 4/1gal 31.10

20 VEGETABLE OIL - Gal
J2902 6/1 GAL 29.02         

21 WALNUTS
23044 2/2.5 LB 34.00         

1
BRAN FLAKES - Individual - 1 

oz 75488 SPO 96/1oz 25.09

2 BRAN FLAKES - Bulk - 35 oz
6709414 4/35 OZ

$15.14       

per case 92331 SPO 4/35oz 14.25

3 CHEERIOS - Individual - 1 oz
84160 96/1oz 19.89

4
CHEERIOS - Bulk - 29 oz - 35 

oz 76254 4/35oz 14.74

5
CINNAMON TOASTIES - 

Individual - 1 oz 84065 96/1oz 20.26

6
CINNAMON TOASTIES - Bulk - 

32 oz - 35 oz 4396446 4/45 OZ

$51.27       

per case 92334 SPO 4/35oz 22.97

7
CORN FLAKES - Individual - 1 

oz 76496 SPO 96/1oz 20.64

8
CORN FLAKES - Bulk - 32 oz - 

35 oz 76255 4/35oz 13.49

9
CREAM OF WHEAT - Bulk - 

28 oz - 35 oz 85523 12/28oz 26.30

10
CREAM OF WHEAT - 

Individual - 1 oz

11
FROSTED FLAKES - 

Individual - 1 oz 10522 96/1oz 22.99

12
FROSTED FLAKES - Bulk - 35 

oz - 45 oz 6781587 4/35 OZ

$16.58       

per case

13 OATMEAL - Individual - 1 oz
76593 48/1oz 9.60

INDIVIDUAL / BULK CEREALS

No Bid
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14 QUICK OATS - 35 oz - 45 oz
85522 12/42oz 28.05

15
RAISIN BRAN - Individual - 1 

oz 10519 SPO 96/1oz 21.20

16 RAISIN BRAN - Bulk - 35 oz
76243 4/35oz 16.55

17 SPECIAL K - Individual - 1 oz
84026 96/1oz 27.99

18
RICE CRISPIES - Individual - 

1 oz 10634 96/1oz 22.99

19
RICE CRISPIES - Bulk - 32 oz - 

35 oz 76256 4/35oz 15.48

20
SHREDDED WHEAT - 

Individual - 1 oz - 1.2 oz 10518 SPO 96/1oz 25.49

21
SHREDDED WHEAT - Bulk - 

32 oz - 35 oz 76253 SPO 4/35oz 25.15

22
TOOTIE FRUTIES - Individual - 

1 oz 10520 96/1oz 22.94

23
TOOTIE FRUTIES - Bulk - 35 

oz 92336 SPO 4/35oz 16.70

1 ANGEL FOOD CAKE - 12/1#
17918 12/16oz 42.50

2 APPLE PIE FILLING - #10
73066 6/#10 43.31

3 BROWNIE MIX - 6/5#
28038 6/5# 26.75

4 BROWNIE MIX, Sugar Free

5 CAKE MIX, CARROT
28139 6/5# 36.49

6
CAKE MIX, CARROT, Sugar 

Free

7 CAKE MIX, CHOCOLATE
27955 6/5# 27.10

8
CAKE MIX, CHOCOLATE, 

Sugar Free

9 CAKE MIX, SPICE
28250 SPO 6/5# 41.75

10 CAKE MIX, YELLOW
27973 SPO 6/5# 23.85 G5228 6/5 LB 24.01         

11 CAKE MIX, WHITE
28221 SPO 6/5# 23.85 G5234 6/5 LB 24.01         

12
CAKE MIX, WHITE, Sugar 

Free

13 CHEESECAKE
28216 6/4# 59.75

14 GINGERBREAD MIX
28114 SPO 6/5# 37.30

15

ICING, READY TO SPREAD: 

MUST BE SHELF STABLE: 

Chocolate - 12 # 45314 12# 23.34

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

DESSERT MIXES

No Bid
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16

ICING, READY TO SPREAD: 

MUST BE SHELF STABLE: 

Vanilla - 12 # 45315 12# 21.95

17
ICING, CHOCOLATE, Sugar 

Free

18 ICING, WHITE, Sugar Free

19 MUFFIN MIX, BANANA NUT 
28014 SPO 6/5# 53.99

20 MUFFIN MIX, BASIC
J7662 6/5 LB 22.77         

21 MUFFIN MIX, BLUEBERRY
28424 SPO 6/5# 25.35

22 MUFFIN MIX, BRAN
76608 SPO 6/5# 52.49

23 MUFFIN MIX, CORN
28217 6/5# 28.78

24 MUFFIN MIX, HONEY BRAN
28225 SPO 6/5# 41.95

1 BEEF BASE
57719 12/1# 49.67

2 BEEF BASE, LOW SODIUM
57716 12/1# 61.94

3 BEEF BROTH, LOW SODIUM

4 BISQUICK MIX
28237 6/5# 25.10

5 BREAD CRUMBS, ITALIAN
29131 6/5# 27.37

6 CHICKEN BROTH
36580 12/48oz 26.44

7
CHICKEN BROTH, LOW 

SODIUM

8 CHICKEN GRAVY
4220364 12/#5

$49.91       

per case 58109 SPO 12/50oz 35.20

9
CHICKEN GRAVY, LOW 

SODIUM 28448

8/15oz 

Poultry 28.95

10 CHICKEN BASE - 1#
57721 12/1# 49.64

11 CHICKEN BASE - 5#
22562 4/5 LB 117.17       

12
CHICKEN BASE, LOW 

SODIUM 57715 12/1# 55.12

13 CRISPY ONIONS
73125 6/24oz 33.29

14 FALAFEL
8022297 2/5 LB

$26.44       

per case

15

INSTANT BROTH & 

SEASONING - BEEF, LOW 

SODIUM 91235 SPO 300/4gm 35.48

16

INSTANT BROTH & 

SEASONING - CHICKEN, 

LOW SODIUM 91236 SPO 300/4gm 35.48

No Bid

COOKING PRODUCTS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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17 MINCED GARLIC, IN LIQUID
68103 6/35oz 34.24

18 PANCAKE MIX
28085 6/5# 21.76

19 PORK GRAVY MIX
57709 8/16oz 31.75

20
PORK GRAVY MIX, LOW 

SODIUM 8877714 8/16 OZ

$35.84       

per case

21 SOY SAUCE, LOW SODIUM
37300 SPO 6/.5gal 37.70

22
STUFFING MIX, CHICKEN - 

6/3.5# 65040 6/55oz 59.41

23
STUFFING MIX, 

CORNBREAD - 6/3.5# W7760 6/56 OZ 66.23         

24
SWEETENED CONDENSED 

MILK - 24/14 oz 9312596 24/14 OZ

$45.49       

per case

25 TEMPURA BATTER
28130 6/5# 48.94

26

THICK-IT INSTANT 

HEALTHCARE FOOD 

THICKENER - PC 76723 SPO 100/6.5gm 14.85

27

THICK-IT INSTANT 

HEALTHCARE FOOD 

THICKENER - Bulk 76732 25# 68.47

28 TOFU - 12/14 oz
0684936 12/14 OZ

$14.28       

per case

29 TOFU - 6/4#
85520 6/4# 32.70

30 TURKEY GRAVY MIX
57698 8/16oz 37.80

31
TURKEY GRAVY MIX, LOW 

SODIUM 28448

8/15oz 

Poultry 27.30

32 VEGETABLE BASE
57696 SPO 6/1# 21.85

33 VINEGAR
56100 4/1gal 6.46

34 WORCESTERSHIRE SAUCE
75181 4/1gal 26.99

35
WORCESTERSHIRE SAUCE, 

LOW SODIUM

1
SALAD DRESSING Low Fat 

French 56058 SPO 4/1gal 34.19

2
SALAD DRESSING Low Fat 

Ranch 78427 4/1gal 39.05

3
SALAD DRESSING Low Fat 

Golden Italian 56025 4/1gal 28.49

4
SALAD DRESSING Low Fat 

Thousand Island 56147 SPO 4/1gal 36.12

5 SALAD DRESSING Catalina
67266 SPO 4/1gal 40.39

6 SALAD DRESSING Italian
56176 4/1gal 31.37

SALAD DRESSINGS

No Bid
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7 SALAD DRESSING Ranch
56171 4/1gal 32.94

8
SALAD DRESSING Thousand 

Island 56175 SPO 4/1gal 32.05

9
SALAD DRESSING POWDER 

MIX, Italian 28215 12/7.6oz 28.86

1 BASIL LEAVES
68055 SPO 3/20oz 36.18 24222 26/OZ          26.07 

2 BASIL, CRUSHED
68023 6/12oz 45.90

3 BLACK PEPPER
69355 SPO 6/1# 81.24 24108 18/OZ 12.18         

4 CELERY SALT
5228465 6/30 OZ

$45.58       

per case 24156 32/OZ            7.03 

5 CHILI POWDER
67992 SPO 6/1# 33.65 22890 17/OZ 8.15           

6 CHIVES, DRIED - 1 oz
67991 SPO 6/1oz 28.20 24012 1/OZ 5.27           

7 CHIVES, DRIED - 6/#10

8 CINNAMON
68011 6/1# 41.28

9 CRUSHED RED PEPPER
67999 6/12oz 34.20

10 DILL WEED
68001 SPO 6/5oz 49.14 10512 5/OZ 11.08         

11 GARLIC, GRANULATED
68002 6/25oz 68.79

12 GARLIC POWDER
69343 SPO 6/19oz 51.30

13 GROUND GINGER
69260 SPO 6/16oz 52.88 24054 16/OZ 14.12         

14 LEMON PEPPER
69345 SPO 6/26oz 62.40 28588 28/OZ 11.62         

15
MONTREAL STEAK 

SEASONING 69350 SPO 6/26oz 53.82 28758 28/OZ 10.31         

16
MRS. DASH SALT 

SUBSTITUTE - ORIGINAL 1116052 300/0.03OZ

$23.64       

per case

17 NUTMEG
69262 SPO 6/16oz 90.78

18 ONIONS, dehydrated
68005 SPO 6/1# 34.50

19 ONION POWDER
68006 SPO 6/20oz 37.20 24400 20/OZ 6.72           

20 OREGANO
68014 3/1.5# 46.17

21 PAPRIKA
68007 SPO 6/16oz 34.20

22 PARSLEY FLAKES
68276 6/2oz 12.60

23 POULTRY SEASONING
69268 SPO 6/12oz 54.01

SPICES

No Bid
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24 TACO SEASONING
56683 5# 14.70

1
CHICKEN NOODLE LO-SO - 

7.5 oz 76569 24/7.25oz 20.94

2
CHICKEN NOODLE LO-SO - 

50 oz 11892 SPO 12/50oz 41.87

3 CREAM OF CELERY - 7.5 oz 

4
CREAM OF CELERY, 

CONDENSED - 50 oz 76592 12/50oz 41.54

5 CREAM OF CHICKEN - 7.5 oz 
36699 24/7.25oz 21.53

6
CREAM OF CHICKEN, LO-SO 

- 7.5 oz 

7
CREAM OF MUSHROOM - 

7.5 oz  36670 24/7.25oz 19.34

9
CREAM OF MUSHROOM - 50 

oz 11290 12/#5CAN 44.91         

10
CREAM OF MUSHROOM LO-

SO #5 36671 SPO 24/7.25oz 19.78

11 TOMATO - 7.5 oz  
76590 24/7.25oz 17.89

12
TOMATO, CONDENSED - 50 

oz 11890 12/50oz 33.80

13 TOMATO LO-SO - #5
4146445 12/50 OZ

$48.55       

per case

14 TOMATO LO-SO - 7.5 oz
36994 SPO 24/7.25oz 18.30

15 VEGETABLE LO-SO - 7.5 oz 
36997 SPO 24/7.25oz 19.31

1
ANGEL FOOD CAKE - Uniced 

- 6/20 oz 5357559 6/20OZ

$35.83       

per case

2 APPLE PIE RAW
48034 6/46oz 32.18

3 APPLE PIE BAKED
48336 6/10" 41.22

4 APPLE PIE SUGAR FREE
6122085 6/10IN

$48.05       

per case  

5 BERRY MEDLEY
45264 2/5# 24.15

6 BLUEBERRY PIE RAW
48092 6/46oz 42.76

7
BLUEBERRY PIE, DIET 

SUGAR FREE

8 BOSTON CREAM PIE
48025 6/33oz 38.35

9 CARROT CAKE premade
48042 4/96oz 72.94

10 CHERRY PIE RAW
48030 6/46oz 42.90

No Bid

FROZEN DESSERTS

SOUP

No Bid

No Bid
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

11
CHERRY PIE, DIET SUGAR 

FREE

12 CREAM PIE:  Banana Cream               
48176 6/27oz 33.19

13 CREAM PIE:  Chocolate                
48089 6/10" 33.15

14 CREAM PIE:  Coconut Cream                                     
48024 6/27oz 33.15

15 FRUIT OF THE FOREST PIE
48040 6/10" 52.48

16
ICE CREAM, CHOCOLATE - 

approx 4 oz 71012 24/4oz 7.47

17
ICE CREAM, STRAWBERRY - 

approx 4 oz 71013 24/4oz 7.47

18
ICE CREAM, VANILLA - 

approx 4 oz 71011 24/4oz 7.47

19
ICE CREAM, VANILLA -

LACTOSE - approx 4 oz 1819242 24/4 OZ

$9.20       

per case

20
ICE CREAM, NSA 

CHOCOLATE - approx 4 oz 71002 24/4oz 6.99

21
ICE CREAM, NSA VANILLA - 

approx 4 oz 71009 24/4oz SF 6.99

22 LEMON PIE
48141 6/36oz 37.15

23
STRAWBERRY RHUBARB 

PIE 9785312 6/46 OZ

$38.90       

per case

24 WHIP TOPPING - 12/32 oz
91000 12/32oz 33.10

25
WHIPPED TOPPING - White - 

12/16oz Bags 10304 12/16oz 40.88

1 APPLE - 46 oz
47050 12/46oz 23.15

2 CRANBERRY - 46 oz
47052 12/46oz 27.29

3 GRAPE JUICE - 46 oz
47051 12/46oz 30.97

4 ORANGE - 64 oz
47057 12/46oz 32.30

5 PINEAPPLE - 46 oz
47058 12/46oz 35.24

6 TOMATO - 46 oz
47060 12/46oz 19.15

7 APPLE EZO - 5.5 oz
47046 48/5.5oz 20.32

8 CRANBERRY EZO - 5.5 oz
14840 48/5.5OZ 20.06         

9 GRAPE EZO - 5.5 oz 
4164497 48/5.5 OZ

$22.51       

per case

10 ORANGE JUICE EZO - 5.5 oz
4164018 48/5.5 OZ

$21.87       

per case

11
ORANGE/PINEAPPLE EZO - 

5.5 oz No Bid

JUICES / DRINK MIXES

No Bid
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

12 PINEAPPLE EZO - 5.5 oz
4121950 48/6 OZ

$20.19       

per case

13 PRUNE EZO - 4 oz
47356 72/4oz 14.40

14 PRUNE EZO - 5.5 oz

15 TOMATO EZO - 5.5 oz
47325 48/5.5oz 16.95

16
V-8 EZO LO SO - 5.5 oz, low 

sodium 47331 48/5.5oz 23.96

17
NO SUGAR ADDED - APPLE - 

5.5 oz

18
NO SUGAR ADDED - GRAPE - 

5.5 oz

19
NO SUGAR ADDED - 

ORANGE - 5.5 oz

20
NO SUGAR ADDED - 

PINEAPPLE - 5.5 oz

21
GRAPE DRINK MIX - 

POWDER - 21-24 oz 27529 12/24oz 17.46

22
ORANGE DRINK MIX - 

POWDER - 21-24 oz 27530 12/24oz 17.46

23
LEMONADE DRINK MIX - 

POWDER - 21-24 oz 27527 12/24oz 17.46

24
PINK LEMONADE DRINK MIX 

- POWDER - 21-24 oz 27532 12/24oz 17.46

25
ICE TEA DRINK MIX - 

POWDER - 21 - 24 oz 27533 12/24oz 17.59

1 AU GRATIN POTATOES - #10
34161 12/20.35oz 57.68

2
BAKED BEANS (Gramma 

Brown) - #10 5112107 6/#10

$26.44       

per case

3 BEEF STEW - 10#
66062 SPO 6/#10 44.23

4 BEETS, SLICED - #10
0173740 6/#10

$22.40       

per case

5 BEETS, DICED - #10
4109328 6/#10

$20.41       

per case

6 BLACK OLIVES - #10
59012 6/#10 36.15

7
BROWN GRAVY, LOW 

SODIUM - #5 57754 8/16oz Dry 32.66

8
CANNONBALL BBQ SAUCE - 

gal 57212 4/1gal 22.00

9
CHEDDAR CHEESE SAUCE - 

#10 63027 6/#10 35.31

10 CHILI SAUCE - #10
57131 6/#10 28.18

11 COFFEE - 14 -16 oz
71105 24/14oz 116.14

12
COFFEE, PILLOW PACK - 2.5 

oz 71021 84/2oz 59.67

No Bid

BULK PRODUCTS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

13
COFFEE, PILLOW PACK - 14 

oz 71105 24/14oz 116.10

14 COFFEE, DECAF - 14 -16 oz
70988 SPO 24/12oz 90.69

15
COFFEE, DECAF, PILLOW 

PACK - 2.5 oz 71260 SPO 84/2.5oz 87.53

16
COFFEE, DECAF, PILLOW 

PACK - 14 oz 6958045 18/14 OZ

$107.36       

per case

17 COLESLAW DRESSING - Gal
56090 4/1gal 38.13

18 CREAM STYLE CORN - #10
62035 6/#10 25.70

19
GARBANZO BEANS (CHIC 

PEAS) - #10 62059 6/#10 21.32

20 GRAPE JELLY - #10
M3894 6/#10CAN 57.15         

21 GRAPE JELLY - 132 oz
91435 6/132oz 43.15

22 GREEN BEANS - #10
60093 6/#10 21.44

23 GREEN BEANS, 14 -16 oz
45244 Frzn 12/2# 20.76

24 GREEN PEPPERS - #10
60095 6/#10 28.95

25
HOT SAUCE, MONARCH or 

equal - gal 61004 4/1gal 21.50

26 JALAPENOS - #10
63065 6/#10 23.21

27 KETCHUP - #10
57081 6/#10 23.62

28 KETCHUP, 12 - 14 oz bottle
4560934 36/14OZ

$37.16       

per case

29 KIDNEY BEANS - #10
62000 6/#10 23.54

30 KIDNEY BEANS, 14 - 16 oz

31 MASHED POTATOES - #10
34139 6/#10 49.70

32
MAYONNAISE,  REGULAR - 

Gal 56205 4/1gal 22.92

33
MAYONNAISE,  LOW FAT - 

Gal 4244513 4/1 GAL

$28.34       

per case

34 MUSHROOMS - #10
68024 6/#10 39.60

35 MUSTARD - 12 oz bottle
57927 12/12oz 17.80

36 MUSTARD - Gal
30058 4/1gal 11.63

37 NORTHERN BEAN - 10#
95412 6/#10 23.21

38 PEANUT BUTTER - 5#
92542 6/5# 42.09

39
PEPPERS, RED & GREEN - 

10# 60095 6/#10 30.04

No Bid
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

40 PICKLES, DILL - gal
61040 2/1gal 13.99

41 PICKLES, DILL - 5 gal
7158815 1/5 GAL

$26.32       

per case

42 PINTO BEANS - #10
62075 SPO 6/#10 21.16

43 PIZZA SAUCE  Grade A - #10
57051 6/#10 24.29

44 POTATOES, DICED - 10#
62084 6/#10 24.45

45
POTATOES, DICED, FRESH 

VAC PACKED - 10# 26026 2/10# 16.66

46
POTATO PEARL Vitamin C 

Enriched - 5# 34139 6/#10 49.70

47
POTATO - SCALLOPED - 

20.35 oz 34165 12/20.35oz 54.30

48 PUMPKIN - #10
62083 6/#10 39.14

49 RAISINS - 30#
92345 30# 58.57

50 RAVIOLI - #10
66065 6/#10 33.05

51 RED PEPPERS - #10
58997 6/#10 31.39

52
REFRIED BEANS - #10 or 115 

oz 62013 6/112oz 37.55

53
REFRIED BEANS, 

VEGETARIAN - #10 5882311 6/#10

$31.22       

per case

54 SALSA - #10
57061 6/#10 30.42

55 SAUERKRAUT - #10
62082 6/#10 24.20

56 SPAGHETTI SAUCE - #10
57336 6/#10 25.05

57
SPAGHETTI SAUCE, LOW 

SODIUM  - #10 56965 SPO 6/#10 24.45

58
STEWED TOMATO, Grade A - 

#10 56970 6/#10 24.10

59
STEWED TOMATO, LOW 

SODIUM Grade A - #10

60
STRAWBERRY PRESERVES - 

4# 91424 6/4# 42.48

61
STRAWBERRY TOPPING - 

5# 31468 6/58OZ 43.77         

62
SWEET POTATOES, syrup 

Grade A - #10 92369 6/#10 31.33

63 TEA BAGS, Regular
71451 10/100ct 26.45

64 TOMATOES, CRUSHED - #10
57016 6/#10 22.76

65
TOMATO PASTE, Grade A - 

#10 59085 6/#10 26.72

No Bid
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

66
TOMATO PASTE, LOW 

SODIUM Grade A - #10

67
TOMATO SAUCE, Grade A - 

#10 57055 6/#10 22.45

68
TOMATO SAUCE, LOW 

SODIUM Grade A - #10 56965 SPO 6/#10 24.45

69 WAX BEANS - 14 - 16 oz
45338 Frzn 12/2# 21.56

70 WAX BEANS - #10
62022 6/#10 25.91

71 VEGETARIAN BEAN - #10
60097 6/#10 23.29

72 3-BEAN SALAD - #10
56124 6/#10CAN 32.71         

73 4-BEAN SALAD - #10
10974 6/#10 31.99

1 CHIPS - Corn
77540 SPO 104/1oz 30.95

2 DORITOS - Cool Ranch - 1 oz
5511910 104/1 OZ

$36.48       

per case 77546 SPO 104/1oz 31.67

3
DORITOS - Nacho Cheese - 1 

oz 77545 104/1oz 31.67

4 FUNYUNS CHIPS - .75 oz
77484 104/.75oz 33.09

5
HOT CHOCOLATE, SUGAR 

FREE PACKET 48229 SPO 6/40ct 36.75

6 ORANGE JUICE - 4 oz
47000 72/4oz 12.97

7 POTATO CHIP - regular - 1 oz
77542 104/1oz 30.94

8 POTATO CHIP - BBQ - 1 oz
77541 104/1oz 30.94

9
POTATO CHIP - Sour Cream 

& Onion - 1 oz 77543 104/1oz 30.94

10 PRETZELS - 1 oz
77532 88/1oz 29.03

11 TORTILLA CHIPS - 2 oz 
78574 

Scoops 72/.875oz 22.85

12 PC APPLESAUCE
64153 96/4.5oz 24.19

13 PC BBQ SAUCE
66218 100/1oz 9.04

14 PC BUTTER cups
25313 720/5gm 29.45

15
PC CEREAL - GLUTEN FREE 

CHEX 84166 96/1oz 20.89

16 PC COFFEE
71220 84/1.75oz 45.94

17 PC COFFEE, DECAF
5259346 5/100 CT

$53.62       

per case

18 PC CREAM CHEESE
25001 100/1oz 18.08

No Bid

INDIVIDUAL SERVING ITEMS
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

19
PC DIET CRANBERRY 

SAUCE 64053 SPO 200/.5oz 24.19

20 PC HALF & HALF
J9342 400/CNT 13.15         

21 PC JELLY - diet
66222 200/12gm 14.38

22 PC JELLY - regular
5258835 400/10 GM

$21.99       

per case

23 PC KETCHUP
4029500 1000/9 GM

$17.84       

per case

24
PC MAPLE SYRUP, Sugar 

Free 66235 SPO 100/1oz 9.12

25 PC MARGARINE cups
82112 900/5gm 21.17

26 PC MAYONAISE
66585 500/9gm 16.30

27 PC MUSTARD
66223 500/4.5gm 7.24

28 PC PANCAKE SYRUP
66229 100/1.5oz 9.25

29
PC PANCAKE SYRUP, Sugar 

Free 66235 SPO 100/1oz 9.20

30 PC PEANUT BUTTER
66527 200/.5oz 21.06

31 PC RELISH
73325 72/.5oz 21.37

32
PC SALAD DRESSING (Italian 

lf) 66219 200/9gm 6.85

33 PC SALT SUBSTITUTE
1116052 300/0.03OZ

$23.64       

per case

34 PC SPLENDA
67002 2000ct 24.97

35 PC SUGAR
67001 2000ct 11.79

36 PC SOUR CREAM cups
27792 100/1 OZ 14.36         

37 PC SWEET & SOUR
66236 100/1oz 10.14

1 APPLES, fresh
88025 40# 120ct 21.30

2
APPLES: sliced, juice or water 

packed, Grade A - #10 10251 6/#10 35.39

3
APPLESAUCE  Unsweetened, 

Grade A - #10 J2962 6/#10CAN 22.09         

4 APRICOTS - Grade A - #10
11266 6/#10 34.41

5 BANANAS, fresh - 150 ct
88036 150ct 22.40

6
FROZEN BERRY MEDLEY - 

20# 45264 2/5# 24.49

7 CABBAGE, fresh
75006 50/LB 10.26         

FRUITS & VEGETABLES, FRESH and CANNED
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FOOD COMMODITIES and DAIRY - NUTRITION and/or PUBLIC SAFETY

AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

8 CANTELOPE, fresh
1164375 1/6 CT

$27.27       

per case 88039 12-15ct 27.98

9 CELERY. Bunch
11990 3/CNT 6.22           

10 COLE SLAW MIX - 4/5# bags
75054 4/5 Lb          19.16 

11
CRANBERRY SAUCE Whole, 

Grade A - #10 73746 6/101 OZ 38.78         

12
CRANBERRY SAUCE, Jellied, 

Grade A - #10 4608907 6/101 OZ

$41.15       

per case

13
CUCUMBERS, fresh - 24-30 

case 9908421 1/10 LB

$10.16       

per case 88110 15# 10.83

14
CRUSHED PINEAPPLE: 

fancy, juice Hawaiian Coarse, 64045 6/#10 21.69

15
FROZEN STRAWBERRIES, 

UNSWEETENED - Grade A - 45177 10# 15.88

16
FROZEN STRAWBERRIES, 

SWEETENED - Grade A - 6/5# 45175 6/6.5# 54.45

17
FRUIT COCKTAIL, Grade A - 

#10 61041 6/#10 29.79

18 FRUIT CUPS, 4 oz - Grade A
46233 36/4oz 18.76

19
FRUIT MEDLEY, 

Festival/Classic, melon pieces, 3856507 2/8 LB

$32.65       

per case

20 GREEN PEPPERS, fresh
75946 1 1/9 BU 19.25         

21 HONEYDEW MELON, fresh
88048 5-6ct 23.25

22
LETTUCE, Iceberg, fresh, 

head 75018 24/Cnt          30.48 

23 LETTUCE, Iceberg, fresh, bag
88131 4/5# 28.60

24
MANDARIN ORANGE, 

sections, light, Grade A - #10 66031 6/#10 29.27

25 ONIONS, fresh
5430202 1/10 LB

$7.57       

per case 78176 50/Lb          12.36 

26 ORANGES, fresh
88348 113ct 34.29 78816 138/CNT 37.22         

27
PEACHES yellow, light cling 

halves, Grade A - #10

64008 

Diced 6/#10 31.48

28
PEACHES sliced, light Grade 

A - #10 63043 6/#10 27.69

29
PEARS halves, light Grade A - 

#10 64019 6/#10 40.53

30
PEARS pieces, light Grade A - 

#10 64012 6/#10 27.50

31
PEPPERS, RED & GREEN - 

frozen - 20# 45109 SPO 25# 24.30

32
PINEAPPLE TIDBITS: light, 

Grade A - #10

64043 in 

juice 6/#10 22.08

33
PINEAPPLE, sliced, juice 

packed, Grade A - #10 63037 6/#10 29.19
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AWARD - DECEMBER 1, 2019 - FEBRUARY 29, 2019

RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

34 PLUMS, fresh
AJ654 28/LB 40.23         

35 POTATOES, fresh
J5700 50/LB 14.74         

36
SEEDLESS RAISINS - Grade 

A 92345 30# 57.07

37 SNOW PEAS
78424 10/Lb          41.73 

38
SWEET POTATO, MASHED - 

frozen 2497089 12/2 LB

$52.84       

per case

39 TOMATOES, fresh
88208 25# 35.05

40
TROPICAL FRUIT, papaya, 

banana - Grade A - #10 64030 6/#10 32.49

41 TURNIPS
8775862 4/5 LB

$40.72       

per case

42 WATERMELON, fresh
88076 1ct 8.21

1 ASPARAGUS, Grade A
45086 6/2.5# 26.90

2
BREAKFAST CUBE 

POTATOES, Grade A 34395 6/5# 42.06

3 BROCCOLI, CUT, Grade A
45131 20# 16.05

4
BROCCOLI SPEARS, Grade 

A 45229 12/2# 24.58

5
BRUSSEL SPROUTS, Grade 

A 45255 12/2# 24.76

6
CALIFORNIA BLEND, Grade 

A 1474964 12/2LB

$25.89       

per case

7 CAPRI MIX, Grade A
45318 20# 19.40

8
BABY CARROTS, whole 

Grade A 45228 20# 22.00

9 CARROTS, CUT, Grade A
45018 20# 15.50

10
CARROTS, DICED, 30#, 

Grade A DB108 20/Lb 10.63         

11 CAULIFLOWER, grade A
3772514 12/2 LB

$20.89       

per case

12 CORN, Grade A
45024 20# 16.45

13
GREEN BEANS, CUT, Grade 

A 45130 20# 13.05

14
GREEN BEANS, ITALIAN 

CUT, Grade A 45336 12/2# 23.95

15
DICED GREEN PEPPERS, 

Grade A 45097 12/2# 23.75

16 FAJITA STRIPS
AG676 12/2 LB 22.94         

17
FRENCH GREEN BEANS, 

Grade A 45253 12/2# 27.79

VEGETABLES - FROZEN
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RENZI REINHARTSYSCOVENDOR NAME

18 HUBBARD SQUASH, Grade A
45174 12/4# 41.99

19 ITALIAN MIX, Grade A
45348 20# 22.40

20
JAPANESE STIR FRY, Grade 

A 45259 20# 24.44

21 LIMA BEANS, Grade A
45312 20# 26.00

22
MIXED VEGETABLES Grade 

A, 5 way mix 45126 12/2.5# 22.21

23 ONIONS, DICED, Grade A
45102 12/2# 23.40

24 ORIENTAL BLEND, Grade A
45259 20# 22.99

25 PEARL ONIONS. Grade A
45359 SPO 12/2# 32.25 G2518 12/40 OZ 40.31         

26 PEAS, Grade A
45136 20# 21.20

27 PEAS/CARROTS, Grade A
45137 20# 19.39

28 SCAND BLEND, Grade A
61788 12/2 LB 17.11         

29 SPINACH, chopped Grade A
45232 12/3# 28.21

30 SWEET PEAS, Grade A
45136 20# 20.15

31 WAX BEANS, CUT, Grade A
G2492 12/2 LB 24.52         

32 WINTER BLEND, Grade A
45099 12/2# 22.80

33 ZUCCHINI. Grade A
45294 20# 22.42

1  BUTTERSCOTCH - 6/10#
73193 6/#10 28.20

2 CHOCOLATE - 6/10#
73191 6/#10 28.15

3
CHOCOLATE POWDER MIX - 

12/2# 5106554 12/2 LB

$49.82       

per case

4 LEMON - 6/10#
73195 6/#10 29.31

5 PISTACHIO - 6/10#

6 TAPIOCA - 6/10#
73196 6/#10 30.51

7 VANILLA - 12/24 oz
73192 6/#10 28.20

8
VANILLA POWDER MIX - 

12/2# 28477 12/24oz 25.81

9
SUGAR FREE - 

BUTTERSCOTCH - 5 oz 28474 SPO 12/5oz 24.53

10
SUGAR FREE - CHOCOLATE 

- 5 oz 28473 SPO 12/3.5oz 21.24

No Bid

PUDDING
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11
SUGAR FREE - VANILLA - 5 

oz 28463 SPO 12/3.5oz 19.15

12
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 

BUTTERSCOTCH -3.5 oz 73187 48/3.5oz 15.76

13
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 

CHOCOLATE - 3.5 oz 73188 48/3.5oz 15.76

14
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 

VANILLA - 3.5 oz 73186 48/3.5oz 15.76

15
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 

DIABETIC, RICE - 4 oz 2496347 48/4 OZ

$20.54       

per case

16
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 

DIABETIC, TAPIOCA - 4 oz 73209 SPO 48/4oz 22.95

17
SNACK PACK PUDDINGS, 

DIABETIC, VANILLA - 4 oz 88862 48/3.25oz 18.10

1 REGULAR - 24 oz- asst
29212 SPO 12/24oz 29.05

2 SUGAR FREE RED - 2.75 oz
28272 SPO 18/2.75oz 36.70

3
SUGAR FREE CITRUS - 2.75 

oz 28273 SPO 18/2.75oz 61.15

1

CHEESE AMER 

PROCESSED SLICED - 

Yellow 25039 4/5# 47.98

2
CHEESE AMER 

PROCESSED SLICED - White
G1248 4/5 LB 53.77         

3 CHEESE, CHEDDAR - Block
2825010 1/10#AVG $2.83 per lb G1306 40+/LB 2.58           

4
CHEESE, EXTRA SHARP - 

Block 25064 NYS 10# 2.66/#

5
CHEESE, MEXICAN - 

Shredded M4638 4/5 LB 53.45         

6
CHEESE, MozZARELLA - 

Shredded - 20lb 24836 4/5 LB 51.02         

7
CHEESE, MozZARELLA - 

Shredded - 30lb G1238 6/5 LB 77.03         

8 CHEESE, SHARP - Shredded
25042 4/5# 58.71

9
CHEESE, SHARP, LOW 

SODIUM - Shredded

10 CHEESE, SWISS - Block
25866 2/8# 2.81/#

11
CHEESE, SWISS, LOW 

SODIUM - Block

12 CREAM CHEESE - 3#
8635740 4/3 LB

$24.54       

per case 25919 10/3# 61.55

13 COTTAGE CHEESE
T8998 4/5 LB 28.49         

14 COTTAGE CHEESE, 1%
25109 4/5# 38.52

No Bid

No Bid

DAIRY

JELLO
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15 LIQUID BUTTER
58470 3/1gal 27.41

16 MARGARINE
98400 30/1 Lb          18.64 

17 PARMESAN CHEESE
25330 4/5# 52.55

18
PIZZA CRUST, rectangular 

par baked 37807 10/43oz 23.00

19 SOUR CREAM
25328 4/5# 26.54 G1372 6/5 LB 35.11         

20 YOGURT - assorted

26086 

Strawb, 

26088 

Stra/bana, 

26087 Vanilla 48/4oz 14.55

21
YOGURT, LIGHT - assorted 

flavors 26078 48/4oz 17.99

22
YOGURT, VANILLA - 2 lb - 5 

lb 6472502 6/4 LB

$26.52       

per case 76516 6/32oz 13.25

23 YOGURT, VANILLA - 4 - 6 oz
26154 SPO 12/6oz 8.89

1

COOKIES, CHOCOLATE 

CHIP, frozen ready to bake 

dough - 1 oz - 1.5 oz 17858 16/LB 30.82         

2

COOKIES, OATMEAL, frozen 

ready to bake dough - 1 oz - 

1.5 oz

3

COOKIES, OATMEAL RAISIN, 

frozen ready to bake dough - 1 

oz - 1.5 oz 17868 16/LB 30.49         

4

COOKIES, PEANUT BUTTER, 

frozen ready to bake dough - 1 

oz - 1.5 oz 11453 SPO 324/1oz 31.84 17678 16/LB 33.17         

5

COOKIES, SUGAR, frozen 

ready to bake dough - 1 oz - 

1.5 oz 17888 16/LB 25.13         

6

COOKIES, WHITE CHIP 

MACADAMIAN NUT, frozen 

ready to bake dough - 1 oz - 

1.5 oz 51594 SPO 213/1.5oz 50.83 17676 16/LB 41.61         

7 FIG NEWTONS
4221461 120/2 PK

$46.92       

per case

8
FIG NEWTONS, individual 

package 72024 SPO 120/1oz 39.15

9
GRAHAM CRACKERS, 

individual package 28125 200/2ct 21.47

10
LORNA DOONE COOKIE, 

individual package 4125852 120/1 OZ

$25.46       

per case

11
SALTINE - KRISPY, individual 

package 73314 500/2ct 12.10

12
SALTINES UNSALTED TOPS, 

individual package 73312 500/2ct 18.98

No Bid

COOKIES & CRACKERS
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13
SUGAR FREE COOKIE, 

Chocolate, individual package 32509 106/.75oz 29.30

14
SUGAR FREE COOKIE, 

Lemon, individual package 32510 106/.75oz 29.30

15
SUGAR FREE COOKIE, Short 

Bread, individual pkg 83086 SPO 120/1oz 42.15

1 COFFEE, REGULAR - 2 oz
71021 84/2oz 57.14

2 COFFEE, DECAF - 2 oz
71216 84/2oz 67.21

3
BLACK PEPPER SHAKER - 

disposable 67190 48/1.5oz 40.78

4
BREAD STICKS - WHOLE 

WHEAT B4616 150/Cnt 30.46         

5
GARLIC BREAD - 

BUTTERTOP 63356 10.5/Lb          26.92 

6
GLUTEN FREE - BAGELS, 

asst 51171 24/3.5oz 26.24

7 GLUTEN FREE - BREAD
10377 12/14oz 49.98

8
GLUTEN FREE - FROZEN 

SHERBERT, asst

93577, 

93578, 93580

96/4oz 

SPO 31.75

9
GLUTEN FREE - MUFFINS, 

asst

51170 

Blueb 36/3oz 41.55

10 HAMBURGER ROLL
0124636 10/12 CT

$34.06       

per case

11 HOT DOG ROLL
2496451 12/12 CT

34.32        

per case

12 KOSHER - BREAD
2492199 10/36 OZ

$38.01       

per case

13
KOSHER - CHOW MEIN 

DINNER

14 KOSHER - CHICKEN DINNER
5572989 6/13.5OZ

$36.83       

per case

15
KOSHER - CHICKEN LEG 

DINNER

16 KOSHER - COLD CUTS

17 KOSHER - FISH DINNER

18
KOSHER - POT ROAST 

DINNER 5735749 6/12 OZ

$38.45       

per case

19
KOSHER - SALISBURY 

STEAK DINNER

20 KOSHER - SLICED CHEESE
6697882 4/5 LB

$56.13       

per case

21
KOSHER - SPAGHETTI & 

MEATBALL DINNER 5574410 6/13 OZ

$36.67       

per case

22 KOSHER - TURKEY DINNER
5735756 6/12 OZ

$36.69       

per case

23 READY MADE BISCUITS - 3"
B5526 120/2.25 31.24         

24 READY MADE BISCUITS - 2"
36843 105/2" 20.15

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

MISC

No Bid

No Bid
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25 SALT SHAKER - disposable
67189 48/4oz 10.70

26 SPRAY COATING (pan)
66424 6/17oz 16.55

27 TORTILLA CHIPS
60054 3/2# 9.97

28 TORTILLA SHELLS
60052 200/5.25" 11.89

1 WHOLE MILK - gal
J4458 4/1 GAL 17.57         

2 WHOLE MILK - 1/2 gal
4666727 6/64 OZ 19.77

3 WHOLE MILK - 8 oz
J9318 50/8 OZ 12.46         

4 SKIM MILK - 1/2 gal
J4460 9/.5 GAL 18.03         

5 SKIM MILK - 8 oz
J9340 50/8 OZ 10.76         

6 2% MILK - 8 oz
J9320 50/8 OZ 11.84         

7 1% MILK - 1/2 gal 
J4410 4/1 GAL 14.49         

8 1% MILK - 8 oz
J9338 50/8 OZ 10.97         

9
CHOCOLATE MILK - 1% - 8 

oz J9322 50/8 OZ 10.86         

10 LACTATE FAT FREE - 8 oz
91128 20/8 OZ 10.98         

11 LACTOSE MILK - 8 oz
6532857 20/8 OZ

$11.28       

per case

12
SILK SOY MILK, VANILLA - 8 

oz 25226 18/8oz 16.99

13
SILK SOY MILK, 

CHOCOLATE - 8 oz 25220 18/8oz 16.99

14 HALF & HALF - 8 oz 

15 HALF & HALF - qt 
J4440 12/32 OZ 22.69         

16 EGG NOG - Seasonal - qt
3279835 12/32 OZ

$31.49       

per case

MINIMUM ORDER 20 CASES

No Bid

MILK
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